
BYLAW NO. 263/14 
 
 
 

  A BYLAW FOR THE VILLAGE OF YOUNG TO AMEND BYLAW NO. 182/99 
  KNOWN AS THE BYLAW TO MAINTAIN, REGULATE AND CONTROL A 
  CEMETERY 
 
 
 
 
 
  The Council of the Village of Young in the Province of Saskatchewan in open meeting 
  hereby enacts as follows: 
 
  1. Bylaw No. 182/99 is amended as hereinafter set forth. 
 
  2. a) Amend Section 8 by deleting “$50.00” and replacing with “$250.00”. 
 
   b) Amend Section 10 by deleting “$250.00” and replacing with “$500.00”. 
 
  3. This Bylaw shall come into force and take effect on the date of final passing 
   thereof. 
 
 
 
 
              
       Mayor (Brian Rowan) 
 
 
 
 
              
       CAO (Belinda Rowan) 


